
Lowcountry Rapid Transit is a 
modern bus rapid transit system 
that will connect communities in 
our region like never before. 
Whether you're traveling on foot, 
on bike, or on the bus, LCRT 
welcomes you. 

Explore the
Possibilities

Now Arriving:
Engineering!

Get Connected:

The Future 
of Transit
We are creating new ways to 
welcome a growing, diverse 
community with expanded transit 
access and new shared moments 
of wonder and delight. 
Connecting us to the experiences 
that bring us together — that's 
what LCRT is all about.

Find us on social media or at
LowcountryRapidTransit.com

Lowcountry Rapid Transit is one 
step closer to reality - and 
receiving hundreds of millions in 
federal funding.

Design work on this transformative 
project will be underway in the 
coming months. Check out the 
timeline below for more details.

LOCAL PLANNING 
Completed 2016

PROJECT PROGRAMMING 
Completed 2019

PROJECT DEVELOPMENT 
Completed 2022

ENGINEERING
We Are Here!

CONSTRUCTION
Est. 2026 - 2029



Operating mostly in dedicated bus 
lanes, LCRT will provide a safe, 
reliable and low-cost connection 
between Ladson, North Charleston 
and Downtown Charleston.

About the System

LCRT is a high-quality transit 
option that delivers fast, 
comfortable and cost-effective 
service, running every 10 minutes 
at 20 stations across the region.

Reliable Modern Service

LCRT is inclusive of all modes of 
travel - transit riders, bicyclists, 
pedestrians and vehicles. Its design 
is ADA-compliant and includes 
enhancements to crosswalks and 
multi-use paths along the corridor.

Accessible to Everyone

Whether you're a commuter, visitor 
or live along the route, LCRT will 
connect you to grocery stores, 
employment centers, healthcare 
and entertainment.

Easy to Use and Enjoy

Creating the connections 
that bring us together.
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